
BID TABULATION
Analytical Balances

Bid #PUR0718-008

July 30, 2018 at 3:00 pm

Line Item Description Qty Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended

1

Mettler Toledo ME204TE/00 analytical 

balance or Equivalent 2 $2,613.60 $5,227.20 $2,145.50 $4,291.00 $2,565.00 $5,130.00 $2,646.27 $5,292.54 $2,783.79 $5,567.58

2

Compatible paird Bluetooth dongle for 

wireless connectivity 2 $403.65 $807.30 no bid no bid $200.00 $400.00 $360.43 $720.86 $369.68 $739.36

3 Compatible USB cable for PC connectivity 2 no bid no bid $79.27 $158.54

Analytical Balance Manufacturer

Model

Compatible with Windows 10

Recommended method of PC connectivity 

with analytical balance model being bid

Maximum capacity
Resolution down to

Total Bid Amount:

Warranty:

How long pricing is held for:

Estimated lead time:

Subcontractors

Signature Page

1 Addendum 1

2 Do You Accept Credit Card for Payment?

3 Quick Pay Discount

4 Does Discount Apply to MasterCard?

$6,306.94

0.1 mg

220 grams

No No No No No

220 grams

0.1 mg 0.1 mg

220 grams

$5,451.08

3 calendar days

Yes

ME204TE/00

N/A

Yes

USB

Yes

ME204TE/00

Mettler Toledo, Inc. Mettler Toledo

VENDORS

Vendor Location

Local Business Certificate on File (Yes/No)

Yes

N/A

N/A

Environmental 

Express

Charleston, SC

No

$6,034.50 $5,530.00

5-7 calendar days

1 year warranty per 

manufacturer

12 months

1-2 calendar days, 

currently stocked in IL

1 year manufacturer 

warranty

12 months

15-30 calendar days

MidSci

Valley Park, MO

Mettler Toledo

ME204TE/00

Fisher Scientific, LLC

Pittsburgh, PA

No

Phenix Research 

Products

Candler, NC

No

VWR International, 

LLC

Suwanee, GA

NoNo  

$4,291.00

2 year warranty - parts 

and labor

until 2019

0.1 mg

220 grams

Yes

No

See Bid

pricing firm through 

12/31/18

5-7 calendar days

Yes

N/A

N/A

12 months - parts and 

labor

through 12/31/18

Mettler Toledo

ME204TE/00

Yes

Bluetooth dongle

Yes Yes Yes

N/A

N/A

2% 10 days

Yes

Yes

No Yes

Yes

N/A

220 grams

0.1 mg

Need RS232 to USB 

cable or flash drive

Yes

W3102A-220

Benchmark Scientific

N/A


